
HERE ARE SOME VERSES
THAT WILL BUILD YOUR FAITH

Prov. 13:7  There is that maketh himself rich, yet hath 
nothing: there is that maketh himself poor, yet hath 
great riches.

Prov. 3:9-10  Honour the LORD with thy substance, and 
with the firstfruits of all thine increase: 10  So shall thy 
barns be filled with plenty, and thy presses shall burst 
out with new wine.

Prov. 11:24-25  There is that scattereth, and yet 
increaseth; and there is that withholdeth more than is 
meet, but it tendeth to poverty. 25  The liberal soul shall 
be made fat: and he that watereth shall be watered also 
himself.

Prov. 11:28  He that trusteth in his riches shall fall: but 
the righteous shall flourish as a branch.

Acts 20:35  I have showed you all things, how that so 
labouring ye ought to support the weak, and to 
remember the words of the Lord Jesus, how he said, It is 
more blessed to give than to receive.

2 Cor. 9:6-8  But this I say, He which soweth sparingly 
shall reap also sparingly; and he which soweth 
bountifully shall reap also bountifully. 7  Every man 
according as he purposeth in his heart, so let him give; 
not grudgingly, or of necessity: for God loveth a cheerful 
giver. 8  And God is able to make all grace abound 
toward you; that ye, always having all sufficiency in all 
things, may abound to every good work:

Phil. 4:19  But my God shall supply all your need 
according to his riches in glory by Christ Jesus.

Gal. 6:7-8  Be not deceived; God is not mocked: for 
whatsoever a man soweth, that shall he also reap. 8  
For he that soweth to his flesh shall of the flesh reap 
corruption; but he that soweth to the Spirit shall of the 
Spirit reap life everlasting.

We are not giving, but sowing.

A man expects to reap when he sows.
A man expects to reap the same kind of seed that he 
sows.
A man expects to reap more than he sows.

God’s shovel is much bigger than ours.

God will be no man’s debtor.
He always returns more to us than we give to Him.
Remember this, we cannot outgive God.

Deut. 11:26  Behold, I set before you this day a blessing 
and a curse; 27  A blessing, if ye obey the 
commandments of the LORD your God, which I 
command you this day: 28  And a curse, if ye will not 
obey the commandments of the LORD your God, but 
turn aside out of the way which I command you this 
day, to go after other gods, which ye have not known.

Matt. 6:33  But seek ye first the kingdom of God, and 
his righteousness; and all these things shall be added 
unto you.


